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                                    Thankyou Sadhana Didi, Rommel Sab and Sonalika   

 

Dear Sadhana Didi, Rommel Sab and Sonalika   
 
As this year draws towards its close, the highlight for us all is that it has been filled with the 
beautiful Divine blessings of the auspicious Music of Joy Tour to India. The highlight of which 
was the time we were invited to come and spent time you all in your home village of 
Shikarpur under the heavenly Bihar skies.  
  
This is why we all take part in these Tours. We would all like to humbly thank you Sadhana 
Didi, Rommel Sab and Sonalika for a once in a lifetime experience. We were all invited into 
your traditional home.  We wish to also acknowledge and appreciate all the tireless hours of 
travel, organisation, and the devoted attention to every detail of the tour contributed by 
Sonalika both in preparation many months before the tour commenced, and once all the 
Yogis arrived. It was exceptional organisation by an exception Sahaja Yogi and revered land 
oved sister for us all.  
 
We all felt the love of generations abound.  From day one of our Tour our journey has been 
the work of Shri Mataji.  Our time shared with you at Shikarpur. It was no mere accident of 
fate, but truly the work of Shri Mataji. We were all awakened to the fact that we have been 
invited to the place that you all revere as home. The time we shared together was so well 
organized and it shows that you all devoted a tremendous effort to host us. So much time, 
expense, and effort you put into making this the most memorable and unforgettable 
experience for us all. We will never forget the time we shared with you at Shikarpur.  
 
You made us feel so welcomed as if we were returning our homes after a long time of 
absence. It was a great honour for us all. We want to thank you. We greatly appreciate you all 
for inviting us so warmly into your home.  We recall the first thing in the morning when we 
awoke to the beautiful sounds of village life and the sounds of nature all around. Our minds 
quietened and our hearts were still and at peace.  It brought us all a great sense of 
tranquillity to experience live lived naturally to the beating heart and rhythms of Mother 
nature while marvelling at God's creation.  As our mind quieten, the sacred space of the 
heart is filled with humility and gratitude to the Almighty. Once again, we realize and are 
grateful for the many blessings of our life. May we continue to constantly keep this 
understanding close to our heart. 
 
We felt and received signs from heaven that Shri Mataji was surely with us when we were 
together with you at Shikarpur, and to recognize the abundance of your love that you 
expressed daily. 
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We were also all humbled to be privileged to enjoy the bounties of your endless grace and 
love enjoyed to the full extent. We will not forget the source from which they come being the 
grace and blessings of Our Divine Mother. 
 
The time we were honoured to share with you as your guests was extraordinary. Each day 
they penetrated and softened our hearts. You are all the living example of the love of Our 
Mother, and as the great instruments of Her love; many great things worked out. 
 
We regularly witness the courage with which you tackle any obstacle while always being in a 
state of appreciation for God’s many blessings. Your eternal optimism and gratitude for the 
divine grace of God which is both contagious and inspires us all to see the good in all things.  
 
The love and affection you bear us that we felt during our time shared with you. It is one of 
the most gracious gifts of the most high and beloved Shri Mataj, our beneficent Divine 
Mother who dwells in the highest of heavens.  
 
For our time shared with you at Shikarpur as your guests we have come to the realization 
that we all cannot thank you enough your unending kindness and love. 
 
Sincerely 

 

LETA Trustee/Directors 

 

 
Chris Kyriacou 

 

 
Hari Gaikwad 
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